
BID TABULATION SHEET
Project Name: 2024 Roof Rehabilitation Program 

Bid Opening: Walter Cook Maintenance Facility 
1645 Carboy Road Mount Prospect, IL 60056

May 3, 2024 at 10:00AM

Company / Contractor Pre-Bid Bid Bond Addendum Base Bid "A" (WCMF) Alternate Bid "A1" (SKYLIGHTS) Base Bid "B" (CCC) Alternate Bid "B1" (2-PLY APP MOD.) Alternate Bid "B2" (EIFS) Total

Combined Roofing Services ✔ ✔ ✔ $324,410.00 $146,550.00 $884,800.00 $278,900.00 $51,900.00 $1,686,560.00

L. Marshall Roofing ✔ ✔ ✔ $344,000.00 $96,000.00 $1,270,000.00 $160,000.00 $41,560.00 $1,911,560.00

DCG Roofing ✔ ✔ ✔ $336,467.00 $74,230.00 $796,450.00 $112,176.00 No Bid $1,319,323.00

CSR Roofing ✔ ✔ ✔ $465,800.00 $153,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $618,800.00

Riddiford Roofing ✔ ✔ ✔ $305,315.00 $43,000.00 $783,350.00 $300,030.00 $18,128.00 $1,449,823.00

Elens & Maichin Roofing & SM ✔ ✔ ✔ $335,300.00 $92,300.00 $878,200.00 $192,700.00 $50,200.00 $1,548,700.00

Adler Roofing ✔ ✔ ✔ No Bid No Bid $1,049,500.00 No Bid $51,570.00 $1,101,070.00

F and G roofing ✔ ✔ ✔ No Bid No Bid $1,248,000.00 No Bid $47,500.00 $1,295,500.00

Metalmaster Roofmaster ✔ ✔ ✔ $354,070.00 $112,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $466,520.00


