Project: RecPlex Pool - Dehumidification Unit Replacement
Bid Opening: Walter Cook Maintenance Facility

1645 Carboy Road Mount Prospect, IL 60056

February 5, 2026 at 11:00AM
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Anchor Mechanical, Inc. Y n/a $939,028.00 $ 1,049,410.00 no bid $ 69,550.00 | $ 15,070.00
MG Mechanical Contracting, LLC Y n/a $844,000.00 $ 882,000.00 no bid $ 60,000.00 | $ 15,000.00
Voris Mechanical, Inc. Y n/a $869,500.00 $ 953,600.00 no bid $ 63,500.00 | $ 14,950.00
Oak Brook Mechanical Services, Inc. Y n/a $846,000.00 $ 855,000.00 no bid $ 55,000.00 | $ 13,700.00
F.E. Moran Inc. Y n/a $915,500.00 $ 955,600.00 no bid $ 58,900.00 | $ 15,200.00
Amber Mechanical Contractors, Inc. Y n/a $892,000.00 $ 925,000.00 no bid $ 76,000.00 | $ 15,200.00

C. Acitelli Heating & Piping Contractors,

Inc. Y n/a $825,000.00 $ 850,000.00 no bid $ 66,000.00 | $ 15,000.00




